Vendor Name
Group 1 Total
Group 2 Total
Group 3 Total
Group 4 Total
Group 5 Total
Group 6 Total
Group 7 Total
Group 8 Total
Group 9 Total
Group 10 Total
Group 11 Total
Group 12 Total
Group 13 Total
Total

Lane Lawn Care Cardinal Landscaping Professional Maintenance Co

Kids' Services Inc

Day 3 Landscape

Blackwell Landscaping

Longleaf Landscaping of Fayetteville

Landart Solutions

V Perry Natural Scape

$9,072.00 $12,420.00 $20,160.00 $30,120.00 $24,800.00 $26,980.00 $22,558.50 $28,320.00 $186,900.00
$9,720.00 $13,061.70 $21,600.00 $29,080.00 $27,700.00 $28,405.00 $27,985.50 $35,640.00 $384,400.00
$3,564.00 $3,874.50 $15,120.00 $10,880.00 $10,000.00 $10,850.00 $8,302.50 $8,124.00|No Bid

$4,212.00 $5,821.20 $8,892.00 $12,580.00 $12,000.00 $12,920.00 $12,474.00 $13,368.00|No Bid

$3,564.00 $5,575.50 $6,120.00 $10,040.00 $9,200.00 $10,640.00 $11,947.50 $12,936.00|No Bid

$8,100.00 $11,963.70 $19,320.00 $22,320.00 $22,600.00 $24,890.00 $25,636.50 $12,900.00 $82,880.00
$3,240.00 $24,871.77 $9,360.00 $15,760.00 $26,600.00 $19,000.00 $43,213.50 $41,604.00|No Bid

$3,888.00 $8,712.90 $8,208.00 $15,680.00 $14,020.00 $15,200.00 $18,670.50 $22,524.00|No Bid

$5,184.00 $7,352.10 $13,440.00 $15,680.00 $14,800.00 $16,150.00 $15,754.50 $17,832.00|No Bid

$6,480.00 $18,314.10 $10,800.00 $18,620.00 $23,820.00 $21,660.00 $39,244.50 $37,512.00|No Bid

$2,916.00 $3,622.50 $6,156.00 $8,800.00 $8,100.00 $8,550.00 $6,075.00 $6,852.00|No Bid

$2,592.00 $5,151.51 $5,760.00 $8,320.00 $7,400.00 $7,980.00 $8,950.50 $9,564.00

$4,212.00
$66,744.00

$6,936.30
$127,677.78

$10,920.00
$155,856.00

$12,760.00
$210,640.00

$11,800.00
$212,840.00

$12,730.00
$215,955.00

$14,863.50
$255,676.50

$20,196.00
$267,372.00

$654,180.00




